
From: Pendergast, Dana
To: Mulholland, Shaun
Subject: FW: FW: ALLENSTOWN, NH REV3 QUOTE and SPEC
Date: Wednesday, March 22, 2017 9:38:16 AM

 
 

From: Chris Champagne [mailto:CChampagne@greenwoodev.com] 
Sent: Thursday, March 16, 2017 5:15 PM
To: McIntosh, Evan <emcintosh@allenstownnh.gov>
Cc: Pendergast, Dana <dpendergast@allenstownnh.gov>
Subject: RE: FW: ALLENSTOWN, NH REV3 QUOTE and SPEC
 
Even
 
I think we need that for loading hose in the crosslays. Let me have them draw the
truck and we can tweak it as necessary. I perceive we are very close to having this
right.
 
Here's where you money stands
 
Equipment allowance-$ 39,403 (To be purchased through Greenwood with truck)

Total for Mini-Pumper-$ 205,341

$244,744 total contract amount for keeping the lease payment equal to Engine 1

 
 
Chris Champagne
General Manager-Greenwood North
207-650-8803 cell phone
207-729-4738 sales/service office
207-729-4737 fax
19 Summer Street
Brunswick, ME 04011

From: Evan McIntosh [EMcIntosh@allenstownnh.gov]
Sent: Thursday, March 16, 2017 11:37 AM
To: Chris Champagne
Subject: Re: FW: ALLENSTOWN, NH REV3 QUOTE and SPEC

Chris,
     We got all the info and pictures, thank you.  Couple things in the specs there still shows the
dunnage box and handrails, should this be removed now we are no longer going that route.  I
also did not see the addition of mounts needed for two pike poles.  Lastly, with all the changes
how does that change the numbers?  I am already putting together a list of equipment need for
the mini-pumper it self and additional things as mentioned.  Thank you for your time and have
a good day.
 
---
Evan McIntosh, Firefighter/EMT

mailto:/O=OEXCH026/OU=EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP (FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/CN=RECIPIENTS/CN=DPENDERGAST@ALLENSTOWND46
mailto:smulholland@allenstownnh.gov


Allenstown Fire Department
1 Ferry Street
Allenstown, NH  03275
(603) 485-9202 
 
EMcIntosh@allenstownnh.gov
 
 
 
Confidentiality Notice:  This e-mail communication and any attachments may contain confidential and privileged 
information for the use of the designated recipients named above.  If you are not the intended recipient, you are 
hereby notified that you have received this communication in error and that any review, disclosure, dissemination, 
distribution or copying of it or its contents is prohibited.  If you have received this communication in error, please 
notify me immediately by replying to this message and deleting it from your computer or electronic device.  
On 03.14.2017 4:33 PM, Chris Champagne wrote:

Good afternoon;
 
I know with a raging snowstorm you probably don't really have time to look at
fire truck specs....but I wanted to pass this along.
 
The specs have been changed to have a flat top style body with a hinged lid
should tank repairs be needed.
 
I also will be forwarding you a bunch of e-mails with photos of trucks Warner
has built. They presently have a mini-pumper coming on line and will share
those photos as it moves along.
 
With this truck and the lease information we provided hopefully we are close
to your needs.
 
Once you give me the up/down on this spec they will do a new drawing as
well.
 
Thank you
 
Chris Champagne
General Manager-Greenwood North
207-650-8803 cell phone
207-729-4738 sales/service office
207-729-4737 fax
19 Summer Street
Brunswick, ME 04011
 

Disclaimer
The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended
solely for use by the recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you
are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the
contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
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